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receivefrom the exporterof the same, for every customary.
thousandthereof,thirteencents,in additionto thefeesnow al-
lowed; andthat this actshallcontinuein forcetwo years,and
thenceuntil theendof thenextsessionof thegeneralassembly.

Pamed March 16, 1?98. Recorded L. B. No. 6, p. 246, etc. Ex.
tended and madeperpetual by Act of March 15, 1800, Chapter 2136.

CHAPTERMCMLXXIX.

AN ACT FOR RAISING, BY WAY OF LOTTERY, THE SUM OF TWO

THOUSAND FOUR HUNDRED DOLlARS, FOR THE PURPOSE OF COM-

PLETING A BRIIDGE OVER BIG SWATABA CREEK, AT JONESTOWN.

[SectionI.] (SectionI, P.L.) Be it enactedby the Senate
and Houseof Representativesof the Commonwealthof Penn-
sylvania,in GeneralAssemblymet, andit is herebyenactedby
the authority of the same,That William Campbell,Valentine
Shousler,Robert Boal, PeterBeasore,Michael Leidigh, Wil-
barn Stewart,Isaac Herrison,Michael Strow, senior, Henry
Stein and PeterSpyker, or a majority of them be, and they
arehereby,appointedcommissioners,to raise,by way of lot-
tery, thesum of two thousandfour hundreddollars, to be ap-
plied by the said commissionersto the purposeof completing
thebridgeoverBig Swataracreekat Jonestown,in the county
of Dauphin.

[SectionII.~ (SectionII, P.L.) And be it further enacted
by the authority aforesaid,Thatthe saidcommissionersabove
namedshall,previousto theirselling any tickets,lay thescheme
of the saidlotterybeforethecourt of quartersessionsfor Dau-
phin county, for their approbation,and shall enterinto bonds
to thegovernorof this commonwealth,in the sum of five thous-
and dollars, for the faithful dischargeof their duty, as well.
in payingall prizes and prize money,as applying the money
so raisedto the completingthebridgeaforesaid,which bonds,
duly executed,shallbe lodgedin the office of the prothonotary
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of Dauphincounty,for theuseof anypersonaggrievedby the
neglector misconductof thesaid commissioners;and the said
commissionersshall lodge in the said prothonotary’soffice a
list of all theprizesandfortunatenumbersdrawnin the same
lottery, and shall also publish the samein one more of the
public newspapersin ReadingandHarrisburg;and all prizes,
whichshallnotbe demandedwithin ninemonthsafterthepubli-
cation of thelist asaforesaid,shall be deemedasgivenup for
the purposeabovementioned,and appliedaccordingly.

Passed March 16, 1798. Recorded 1.. B. No. 6, p. 250.

CHAPTER MCMLXXX.

AN ACT TO ENABLE THE OWNERS AND POSSESSORSOF THE BRISTOL

ISlAND MEADOWS, IN THE TOWNSHIP OF BRISTOL, AND COUNTY OF

BUCKS, TO KEEP THE BANKS, DAMS, SLUICES AND FLOOD GATES IN

REPAIR, AND TO RAISE A FUND TO DEFRAY THE EXPENSES

TBEREOF.

Whereasthereis a certainparcelof meadowland,called the
Bristol Islandmeadows,the propertyof JohnMassey,James
Sterling, Israel Tonkin, John Huston, and William Hewson,
situatein thetownshipof Bristol; andcountyof Bucks,bound-
ing the river Delaware,and lying about a mile above the
mouthof Neshaminycreek,which for a considerabletime past
ha~beenembanked,butwhichhasof latebeengreatlyimpaired
and out of order, for wantof propermanagementandregula-
tions. And whereasall the ownersof the said meadowshave,
by theirpetition,prayedthelegislaturefor a law, to enablethe
ownersand possessorsof the meadowsaforesaidto keep the
banks,dams, sluicesand flood gatesin repair, and to raisea
fundto defraytheexpensesthereof,in suchmannerandform as
that eachshallbearanequalratablepropositionof burden,ac-


