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thereofanypersonSoSuppressedShallpresumetoKeepanyOrdinary
or DrinkingHouseagainSuchPersonafterConvictionthereofin open
CourtShall forfeitTenPoundsto beput into the CountyStockwhere
Suchoffenceis Committedto beAppropratedtowardsthe Defraying
thePublickChargeoftheCountyExcepttheSaidPersonSooffending
be Again recommendedasAbove And his or her LycenceThereupon
Renewed,AndIf SuchPersonorPersonsSooffendinganddo or Shall
forfeit as Aforesaidshall refuseto Pay the Samethen it shall be
Lawfull foranyTwo Justicesof thePeaceto IssueforththeirWarrant
Directedto theSherifof theCountyor hisDeputyto Leavythe Same
byDistressAndSaleof hisorherGoodsReturningtheOverplustothe
Ownerif Any beAndwhereNoeEffectsto distrainon,areto befound
to sattisf~re,In such Casethe Said Personso offending Shall be
Committed to the County Goale, or houseof Correction there to
Remaintwo MonthsAnd to be KeeptAt hardLabourto theuseof the
County and that the JusticesShall Causehis or her Sign to be
ImmediatelyPulld Down for Every offenceafterthe saidfine of ten
Poundsor two monthsImprisoningasaforesaid-Thisactto Continue
DureingtheProprietorsPleasureAndno Longer

A.P.S.,Original Lawsof Pennsylvaniafrom 1693 to 1700,f. 159.
H.S.P.,CadwaladerCollection.Act of May 18, 1699, chapter7. See
Vol. II St.L. 93,ch. LXXVIII.

CHAPTER148.

THE LAW FOR APOINTING AN OFFICER TO RECTIFIE & STAMPALL MONY

WEIGHTS.

Whereasthereis aGenerallComplaintamongthe Inhabitantsof
this ProvinceandTeritoriesfor want of a Standerdfor the money
WeightsBe it Enactedby the Authority AforesaidThat no Person
within thisGovernmentfromandafterthe24Dayof the7Monthnext
ShallbeOblidgedto ReceiveorTakeanymoneybyanyWeightswhich
arenotmadeof BrassRegulatedandStamptby the Personthatnow
is or Shallbehereafterappoyntedfor thatPurposeWhichsaidOfficer
shallkeepein his Possessionat all TimesaTrueStanderdof Brass
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Troy WeightsAccordingto theKingsStanderdofEnglandbywhichhe
ShallTruly andExactlyRegulateall PersonsWeightsthat shallbe
broughtto him andStamptheSamewith hisStamp;fortheDoeingof
whichheShallhaveonepenyfor everyweightSoStamptandRectified
which Said Officer Shall havepower oncein 3 Years To Call any
Personsweightsto aNewTryall andStampif OccasionbeAndfor the
more SpeedyPutting this Law In Execution It shall andmay be
Lawfull for ThomasPaschallSeniorof Philadelphiato Executethe
SameasLong astheGovernor& CouncilshallseemeetAnd in Case
of Death or other OccasionsThe GovernorandCouncil shall have
powerto NominateandAppoyntanyotherpersonin hisRoomAnd
whereasDifferancehathArisen abouttheGoodnessandExactnessof
ScalesIt Shallbe Lawfull for theReceiverof Moneyto Choosewhich
endof theBeametheywill havethemoneyweighedonIf thePayerbe
owner of the ScalesAnd if the Money Turn the ScaleIt shall be
AccountedPassable

A.P.S.,OriginalLaws of Pennsylvaniafrom 1693 to 1700,f. 163.
H.S.P.CadwaladerCollection.ActofMay 18,1699,chapter8.SeeVol.
H St.L.86,ch. LXXI.

CHAPTER149.

THE LAW TO PREVENTTHE RUNNINGOFSTONEHORSESATT LARGE.

BeeIt Enactedby theAuthority aforesaidThat No Personwithin
this Governmentshall from andAfter the first dayof The Second
MonthnextEnsueingSufferanyStonehorsetoRunatUargeaftertwo
YearsOld underThirteenhandshigh, four inchesto thehand,upon
forfeiting theSumof TwentyShillingsforeverySuchhorsesorunning
att large,which Shallbeby theownerof everySuchhorsepaidto any
freeholder,housekeeperOr Rangerof theCountywithin thisGovern-
mentwhoShalltakeup andbringinanySuchhorsein theSecondand
ThirdMonths,ButwhereTheOwnerofthesaidhorseCannotbefound
or knownin oneWeekstime nextafterhis or beingtakenup Thento
be DelivereduntotheRangerofthe CountywhoShallCausethe Said
Horseto beegeldedandPublished,by fixing his Artificiall Marksin


