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CHAPTER DCCCXXIV.

A SUPPLEMENTTO THE ACT, ENTITLED “AN ACT FORSETTLING THE
ACCOUNTS OF THE LATE COMMITTEE AND COUNCIL OF SAFETY.” 1

(Section I, P. L.) Whereasby an act, entitled “An act for
settling the accountsof the late,committee andcouncil of
safety,” 1 William Moore, JosephDeanandDavid Rittenhouse
wereappointedauditorswith full powersto audit, collect, ad-
just, liquidateandsettletheaccountsof thesaidcommitteeand
council of safety:

And asthesaidWilliam Moore, JosephDeanandDavid Rit-
tenhousehaveseverallyresignedtheir saidappointmentsand
refusedto acttherein:

tSectionI.] (SectionII, P.L.) Be it thereforeenacted,andit
is herebyenactedby the Representativesof theFreemenof the
Commonwealthof Pennsylvaniain GeneralAssemblymet,and
by the authorityof the same,That JohnNixon, JohnMaxwell
NesbittandBenjaminFuller be, andtheyareherebyappointed
auditors in the place and stead of the said William Moore,
JosephDeanandDavid Rittenhouse,with all the powersand
authoritiesfor carryingthe saidact, to which this is asupple-
ment into effect, asif theythe saidJohnNixon, JohnMaxwell
NesbittandBenjaminFuller hadbeennamedin thesaidact.

[SectionII.] (SectionIII, P. L.) And beit enactedby theau-
thority aforesaid,That the saidauditorsshalleach,andsever-
ally, receivefor their trouble in the saidbusiness,the sum of
four pounds,ten shillings per diem, for eachdaytheyshall at-
tendandbeemployedin auditingtheaccountsasaforesaid.

PassedDecember6, 1778. Seethe note to theAct of Assembly
passedSeptember2, 1778,Chapter806. The actin thetext wasre-
pealedby theAct of AssethblypassedMarch1, 1780,, Chapter882.

1 PassedSeptember2, 1778, Chapter806.


