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sionsof thepeace,shallbeheld within the aforesaidcircuit or
district, agreeablyto the following arrangement;that is, in
the county of Beaver, on the first Mondays of February,
August andNovember;in the county of Butler, on the Mon-
days next following the courts in Beaver; in the county of
Mercer on the Mondaysnext following the courtsin Butler;
in the county of Crawford on the Mondays next following
the courts in Mercer; in the county of Erie, on the Mondays
next following the courtsin Crawford.

ApprovedApril 2, 1808. Recordedin L. B. No. 9, p. 230.
Note (9. Chapter2130; 16 Statutesat Large, p. 454.

CHAPTER MMCCCXCII.

AN ACT TO ERECT PART OF SOUTH IRWIN TOWNSHIP, IN THE
COUNTY OF VENANGO, INTO A SEPARATE ELECTION DISTRICT.

SectionI. (Section I, P. L.) Be it enactedby the Senate
andHouseof Representativesof the Commonwealthof Penn-
sylvania in GeneralAssembly met, and it is herebyenacted
by theauthorityof thesame,Thatfrom andafter the passing
of this act, the following describedpart of SouthIrwin town-
ship, in the county of Venango,shall be a separateelection
district, viz. Beginningon the westvergeof Allegheny river
nearthe housenow occupiedby Daniel Fry; thenceduewest
to the countyline dividing the countiesof VenangoandMer-
cer; thencesouthwardalong the line dividing said counties,
to the southwestcorner of Venangocounty; thenceeastward
along the line dividing the countiesof Venangoand Butler
to the verge of Allegheny river; thenceup the sameto the
placeof beginning;andthe electorsthereof shall bold their
generalelectionsat thehousenowoccupiedby Patrick David-
son, to be known by the nameof SouthIrwin district.

ApprovedApril 2, 1808. RecordedIn L. B. No. 9, p. 285.


